
THE TOWN AND COUNTRY PLANNING
(GENERAL DEVELOPMENT PROCEDURE)

(ENGLAND) ORDER 2015

PLANNING (LISTED BUILDINGS AND
CONSERVATION AREAS) ACT 1990

SECTIONS 67 & 73

Notice is hereby given that the following
applications have been submitted to the
Council. The Codes are as follows: ASCON
Affecting the Setting in a Conservation Area
ASLCO Affecting Setting of Listed Building in
Cons area CA Conservation Area 

21/00714/HP Worcester City CA Proposed
erection of a pitched roof single storey rear/
side garage, proposed erection of a flat
roofed single storey side/ rear extension and
proposed roof terrace above an existing
single storey side extension with balustrade
and privacy screen. 5 Barbourne Court
Barbourne Crescent Worcester WR1 3LJ

21/01049/FUL Worcester City ASLCO
Change of use of First, Second and Third
Floors to 5No. Apartments. Ground floor
remains commercial use. 3 Foregate Street
Worcester WR1 1DB

21/01050/LB Worcester City ASLCO
Change of use of First, Second and Third
Floors to 5No. Apartments. Ground floor
remains commercial use. 3 Foregate Street
Worcester WR1 1DB

21/01119/FUL Worcester City ASCON
Change of use of land to form a secure
walking field. Land north of Claines Lane
Worcester

21/01121/FUL Worcester City CA
Demolition of existing building and replaced
with a three storey residential development. 7
Newport Street Worcester WR1 3NG

21/01128/ADV Worcester City ASCON 3no
internally illuminated flex skins to existing flex
boxes, 2no non-illuminated poster frame
boxes & soffit stripes to front elevation
cladded roof. Shrub Hill Retail Park, Unit 7
George Street Worcester WR1 2DD

Town and Country Planning (Consultation)
England Direction 2009.

Town and Country Planning (General
Development Procedure) Order 2015 - Article
15.

A copy of the above listed applications, plans
and other documentation can be viewed at
or alternatively at the address below. Any
objections or representations concerning the
proposal may be sent to  to reach them on or
before 16/01/2022.


